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VENDOR NAME

1 LIQUID 
ALUMINUM 

SULFATE
2 LIQUID CAUSTIC 

SODA

3 HYDRO-
FLUOROSILICIC 

ACID
4 ANHYDROUS 

AMMONIA 5LIQUID CHLORINE
6 NON-IONIC 

POLYMER

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS US LLC $1.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

POLYDYNE, INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.6500

AIRGAS SPECIALTY PRODUCTS NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.1000 NO BID NO BID

DPC INDUSTRIES NO BID $2.3400 $369.2000 NO BID $496.0000 NO BID

HAWKINS NO BID $2.3800 $340.0000 NO BID $492.0000 $1.9200

THUNDER BAY CHEMICALS $0.8728 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

C & S CHEMICALS $0.9190 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

UNIVAR USA $1.3404 $2.2362 $560.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

AFFINITY CHEMICAL, LLC. $1.0490 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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