
A PLUS UDEEN ASPEN KLEINSCHMIDT MORINVILLE EASYLIVING JOPRO
REGION 1 $16,966.00 NO BID $18,284.00 NO BID NO BID $27,640.00 $18,614.00
REGION 2 $12,051.00 NO BID $13,675.00 NO BID NO BID $16,510.00 $13,503.00
REGION 3 $27,400.00 NO BID NO BID $34,750.00 NO BID $35,530.00 NO BID
REGION 4 $17,346.00 $18,946.28 NO BID $23,650.00 $15,979.00 $24,115.00 NO BID
REGION 5 $9,820.00 $10,202.83 NO BID NO BID $9,399.00 $18,190.00 NO BID

HOURLY RATE FOR RAKING $37.50 $30.00 $85.00 $50.00 $25.00 $15.00 $26.50

18-01AA 2018 GRASS CUTTING - VARIOUS CITY LOCATIONS
BIDS OPENED 1/23/18
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