CITY OF DULUTH
Aggregates for 2017 - REBID
Bids Opened January 12, 2017
Project 17-0025

Estimated Tons | Veit (price per Excavating (price | Ulland Brothers | Duluth Ready Mix
VENDOR: Per Location ton) per ton) (price per ton) (price per ton)
Class V Gravel (Virgin
Material) $6.63 $6.00|no bid $6.00
Delivery to Garfield
Svc Center 20,000 $8.54 $7.50|no bid $5.45
Delivery to 105 N
40th Ave W 2,500 $7.56 $7.50|no bid $5.45
Delivery to Kenwood
Pit- Hovland Lane &
Kenwood Ave 3,500 $9.31 $7.50|no bid $5.45
Class V Gravel (25%
Recycled) $6.39 $8.00 $6.75|no bid
Delivery to Garfield
Svc Center 20,000 $9.08 $7.50 $6.50|no bid
Delivery to 105 N
40th Ave W 2,500 $8.11 $7.50 $7.30|no bid
Delivery to Kenwood
Pit- Hovland Lane &
Kenwood Ave 3,500 $10.18 $7.50 $4.90|no bid
3/4-IN washed crushed
rock $12.07 $12.00|no bid $13.00
Delivery to Garfield
Svc Center 1,000 $9.42 $8.00|no bid $5.45
Rip Rap $41.34 $19.00(no bid $20.00
Delivery to Garfield
Svc Center 500 $2.98 $14.00|no bid $8.00
Bedding Sand $3.53 $6.50|no bid $7.00
Delivery to Garfield
Svc Center 500 $9.08 $7.50|no bid $5.45
Washed Sand $5.03 $7.60|no bid $7.00
Delivery to 1123
Mesaba Ave 5,170 $9.97 $7.00|no bid $5.45
Delivery to 105 N
40th Ave W 5,000 $8.54 $7.40|no bid $5.45
Delivery to 2407
Commonwealth Ave 500 $7.99 $7.50|no bid $5.45




