Project 1 Project 2 Qualified? Project 3 Project 4 Project 5 Total vendor bid Mob DH Mob DH & XC Mob XC
Blue DH Jump Line | DH Connectors & Reroutes Enduro XC Connector | Enduro XC Loop | Adaptive XC Trail No MOB
Dirt Tek Trails 173,204.00 72,007.50 yes No Bid No Bid No Bid 245,211.50 9,258.75 149,258.75 9,258.75
Path Finder Trail Building 119,694.00 44,390.00 yes No Bid No Bid 80,462.00 244,546.00 5,400.00 10,800.00 5,400.00
Rock Solid 105,842.50 43,023.00 yes 151,437.00 168,825.50 114,524.50 583,652.50 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
Zenith Trail Contracting 81,631.25 30,841.00 yes 122,511.40 94,500.65 141,760.00 471,244.30 1,500.00 2,000.00 1,500.00




