PROJECT TITLE: Duluth Police Headquarters

BID CLOSE: 2:00 p.m., Tuesday August 9, 2011

BID # 11-25DS - POLICE DEPARTMENT FURNITURE

LHB PROJECT #: 080321

CITY OF DULUTH PROJECT #: 09.28.B

BID TAB FORM SUMMARY

ADDENDUM LOT BREAKDOWN
RECEIVED
BIDDERS TOTAL BID Lot 1-B Lot 1-B Lot 1-C Lot 2-A Lot 2-B Lot 2-C Lot 3-A Lot 3-B Lot 3-C Lot 4-A
(Name, Address & Contact) #1 #2 #3 Private Office & | Private Office | Private Office | Task & Conf. | Task & Conf. | Task & Conf. | Multi- Purpose | Multi- Purpose | Multi- Purpose | Design Services
Systems Furn, & Systems & Systems Seating, Seating, Seating, Travel Seating, Seating, Seating, Travel
Materials Furn, Furn, Travel Materials Installation Materials Installation
Installation
Duluth T Busi Furnit Inc.
uluth Type & Business Furniture Inc $296,377.00 Included Included $88,329.00 Included Included $16,422.00 Included Included
30 North 3rd Avenue West
Duluth MN 55802 Y Y Y $401,128.00 $0.00
Contact: John Santori, 218-722-5811 $296,377.00 HEZe00 SllsAZZ 00
North Busi P
orthern Business Products $261,285.97 Included Included | $98,099.36 | Included $0.00 $17,92752 |  Included $0.00
2326 West Superior Street
Duluth. MN 55806 Y Y Y $377,312.85 $0.00
Contact: Paul Olson, 218-726-0167 $261,285.97 $98,099.36 $17,927.52
Parameters
800 Hennepin Avenue, Suite 500 i i i i i i $20,176.00 $1,845.00 Included
. . N N N $22,021.00 $0.00
Minneapolis, MN 55403 No Bid No Bid $22,021.00
Contact: Dana Schaeffer, 952-833-3369 e
ECO, LLC
. $102,305.38 - - - $79,359.66 $2,672.00 $0.00 $21,494.72 $779.00 $0.00
400 West Superior Street
Duluth, MN 55802 Y Y Y 30.00
Contact: Julie McDonnell, 218-626-1118 [$104,305.38] No Bid $80,031.66 [$82,031.66] $22,273.72
ECO, LLC . - - - $65,961.66 $2,672.00 $0.00 $21,494.72 $779.00 $0.00
400 West Superior Street
Duluth. MN 55802 Y Y Y $90,907.38 $0.00
Contact: Julie McDonnell, 218-626-1118 No Bid SR AT
OM Workspace $194,633.37 | $16,734.45 | $5,096.67 - ; ; $25,757.06 | $1,128.89 $378.89
7500 Meridian Circle North
Maple Grove, MN 55369 Y Y Y $243,729.33 $65/HR
Contact: Rand Mako, 763-443-2465 FAGATLAY No Bid ST
OM Workspace - ; ; ; . - $25,279.84 | $1,128.89 $378.89
7500 Meridian Circle North
Y Y Y $26,787.62
Maple Grove, MN 55369 No Bid No Bid $26,787.62
Contact: Rand Mako, 763-443-2465 o
Fluid Interiors $310.301.61 $181,203.46 | $16,505.68 | $3906.82 | $66,095.64 | $3,650.91 $286.50 | $35.661.60 | $1,322.50 $95.50
100 North 6th Street, Suite 100A T B RN T T T ' T T '
Minneapolis, MN 55403 Y Y Y >1,000.00
Contact: Berk Claiborne, 612-746-8740 [$309,728.61] $201,615.96 $70,033.05 $37,079.60
Henricksen P
enricksen PSG . $402,579.21 $259,473.11 $1,150.00 | $2,500.00 | $110,884.50 $0.00 $450.00 | $28,121.60 $0.00 $450.00
1101 West River Parkway, Suite 100 v v v $0.00
aneapO“S’ MN 55415 [$403,029.21] $263,123.11 $111,334.50 $28,571.60

Contact: Larry Voelkers, 612-330-0049

NOTE: RED TEXT INDICATES A MATHEMATICAL ERROR IN BID AMOUNT; CORRECTED VALUE IS IN BRACKETS - SHADED CELLS INDICATE ALTERNATE PRODUCT SUBMITTALS (PER ADDENDA)
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